City of San Pablo, CA

LANGUAGE TO BE REMOVED FROM SECTION 15.040.020.D.

(Shown with strike-out)

§ 15.04.020. Amendments, additions and deletions.

A. Amendments, Additions and Deletions to the 2022 California Building Code,
Chapter 1, Division |1, Scope and Administration.

1.

New Section 105.3.2.1 is added as follows:

105.3.2.1 Expiration of Plan Review. Applications for which no permit is
issued within 180 days following the date of last plan review correspondence
by either the City or the applicant will expire by limitation, and plans and other
data submitted for review may thereafter be destroyed by the Building Official.

New Section 105.5.2 is added as follows:

105.5.2. Completion of work after permit expiration. Before work on an
expired permit can be recommenced, a new permit shall first be obtained
and the fee for such new permit shall be one-half the amount required for a new
permit for such work or as deemed by the Building Official, provided no
changes have been made or will be made in the original plans and specifications
for such work; and provided further that such suspension or abandonment has
not exceeded one year. Any suspension or abandonment in excess of one year
shall be treated as a new permit and subject to all the provisions thereof.

New Section 109.4.1 is added as follows:

109.4.1 Investigation fee for work without permit. Whenever any work for
which a permit is required has been commenced without first obtaining said
permit, an investigation shall be made before a permit may be issued for such
work. An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall be collected
whether or not a permit is then or subsequently issued. The investigation fee
shall be as set forth in the City’s adopted fee schedule. The payment of such
investigation fee shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other
provisions of either this code nor from any penalty prescribed by law.

Section 109.6 is amended to read as follows:

109.6 Refunds. The Building Official shall not authorize the refunding of any
fee paid except upon written application filed by the original permittee not later
than 180 days after the date of fee payment.

The Building Official may authorize the refunding of any fee paid hereunder
which was erroneously paid or collected.

The Building Official may authorize the refunding of not more than 80 percent
of the permit fee paid when no work has been done under a permit issued in
accordance with this chapter.

The Building Official may authorize the refunding of not more than 80 percent
of the plan review fee paid when an application for a permit for which a plan

Downloaded from https://ecode360.com/SA4625 on 2026-02-09


https://ecode360.com/SA4625

City of San Pablo, CA
8 15.04.020 8 15.04.020

review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan checking is
done.

5.  New Section 109.7 is added as follows:

109.7 Reinspection fee. A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection
or reinspection when such portion of work for which inspection is called is not
complete or when corrections required by the Building Official are not made.

This section does not require reinspection fees the first time a job is rejected
for failure to comply with the requirements of the codes. Subsequent
inspections or the practice of calling for inspections before the job is ready for
such inspection or reinspection may be subject to reinspection fees.

To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall file an application therefor in
writing upon a form furnished for that purpose, and pay the reinspection fee in
accordance with the fee schedule adopted by the City.

In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional
inspection of the work will be performed until the required fees have been paid.

B. Amendments, Additions and Deletions to 2022 California Residential Code,
Chapter 1, Division Il, Scope and Administration.

1. New Section R105.3.2.1 is added as follows:

R105.3.2.1 Expiration of Plan Review. Applications for which no permit is
issued within 180 days following the date of last plan review correspondence
by either the City or the applicant will expire by limitation, and plans and other
data submitted for review may thereafter be destroyed by the Building Official.

2. New Section R105.5.1 is added as follows:

R105.5.1 Completion of work after permit expiration. Before work on an
expired permit can be recommenced, a new permit shall first be obtained
and the fee for such new permit shall be one-half the amount required for a new
permit for such work or as deemed by the Building Official, provided no
changes have been made or will be made in the original plans and specifications
for such work; and provided further that such suspension or abandonment has
not exceeded one year. Any suspension or abandonment in excess of one year
shall be treated as a new permit and subject to all the provisions thereof.

3. Section R108.5 is amended to read as follows:

R108.5 Refunds. The Building Official shall not authorize the refunding of any
fee paid except upon written application filed by the original permittee not later
than 180 days after the date of fee payment.

Downloaded from https://ecode360.com/SA4625 on 2026-02-09


https://ecode360.com/SA4625

City of San Pablo, CA

§ 15.04.020 § 15.04.020

The Building Official may authorize the refunding of any fee paid hereunder
that was erroneously paid or collected.

The Building Official may authorize the refunding of not more than 80 percent
of the permit fee paid when no work has been performed under a permit issued
in accordance with this chapter.

The Building Official may authorize the refunding of not more than 80 percent
of the plan review fee paid when an application for a permit for which a plan
review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan checking
has commenced.

New Section R108.6.1 is added to read as follows:

R108.6.1 Investigation fee for work without permit. Whenever any work for
which a permit is required has been commenced without first obtaining said
permit, an investigation shall be made before a permit may be issued for such
work. An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall be collected
whether or not a permit is then or subsequently issued. The investigation
fee shall be as set forth in the City’s adopted fee schedule. The payment of such
investigation fee shall not exempt any person from compliance with any
provision of this code or from any penalty prescribed by applicable law.

New Section R108.7 is added as follows:

R108.7 Reinspection fee. A reinspection fee may be assessed for each
inspection or reinspection when the portion of work for which inspection is
called is not complete or when corrections previously required by the Building
Official are not made.

This section does not require reinspection fees the first time a job is rejected
for failure to comply with the requirements of the codes. Subsequent
inspections or practice of calling for inspections before the job is ready for such
inspection or reinspection may be subject to reinspection fees.

To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall file an application therefor in
writing using a form furnished for that purpose, and pay the reinspection fee in
accordance with the fee schedule adopted by the City.

In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional
inspection of the work will be performed until the required fees have been paid.

C. Amendments, Additions and Deletions to 2021 International Property Maintenance
Code (IPMC).

1.

Section 102.3 of the IPMC is amended to read as follows:

IPMC 102.3 Application of other codes. Repairs, additions or alterations to
a structure, or changes of occupancy, shall be made in accordance with the
procedures and provisions of the City Municipal Code and the California

Downloaded from https://ecode360.com/SA4625 on 2026-02-09


https://ecode360.com/SA4625

City of San Pablo, CA
§ 15.04.020 8 15.04.020

Building Codes.
2.  New Section 102.3.1 of the IPMC is added as follows:

IPMC 102.3.1 Reference to other codes. Whenever the International Property
Maintenance Code refers to other codes, those other codes shall mean the City
Municipal Code and the California Building Codes.

3. Section 302.4 of the IPMC is amended to read as follows:

IPMC 302.4 Weeds. Premises and exterior property shall be maintained free
from weeds and other uncontrolled herbaceous growth in excess of eight (8)
inches in height. Noxious weeds shall be prohibited. Weeds shall be defined as
ornamental and uncultivated grasses and herbaceous vegetation that when
mature bear wingy or downy seeds, or which because of having attained such a
height or extensiveness of growth and desiccation have become a fire menace,
or which are otherwise noxious or dangerous to health or safety.

4. Section 304.14 of the IPMC is amended to read as follows:

IPMC 304.14 Insect Screens. During the entire year, every door, window
and other outside opening required for ventilation of habitable rooms, food
preparation area, food service areas or area where products to be included
or utilized in food for human consumption are processed, manufactured,
packaged or stored shall be supplied with approved tightly fitting screens of
minimum 16 mesh per inch (16 mesh per 25 mm) for purposes of insect control,
except that such screens shall not be required where air curtains or insect
repellent fans are employed. Every screen door used for insect control shall
have a self-closing device in good working condition.

Exception: Screens shall not be required where other approved means of insect
control, such as air curtains or insect repellent fans, are employed.

5. Section 308.3.1 of the IPMC is amended to read as follows:

IPMC 308.3.1 Amended — Disposal of Garbage. That portion of the sentence
reading “an approved incinerator unit in the structure available to the occupants
in each dwelling unit” is hereby deleted in its entirety.

6. Section 602.4 of the IPMC is amended to read as follows:

IPMC 602.4 Amended — Occupied Work Spaces. Indoor occupiable work
spaces shall be supplied with heat during the entire year to maintain a
temperature of not less than 65°F (18°C) during the period the spaces are
occupied.

Exceptions:

1. Processing, storage and operation
areas that require cooling or special
temperature conditions.

Downloaded from https://ecode360.com/SA4625 on 2026-02-09


https://ecode360.com/SA4625

City of San Pablo, CA

§ 15.04.020 8§ 15.04.020
2. Areas in which persons are primarily
engaged in  vigorous physical

activities.

Downloaded from https://ecode360.com/SA4625 on 2026-02-09


https://ecode360.com/SA4625

City of San Pablo, CA
§ 15.04.020 8 15.04.020

Downloaded from https://ecode360.com/SA4625 on 2026-02-09


https://ecode360.com/SA4625

City of San Pablo, CA
§ 15.04.020 § 15.04.020

Downloaded from https://ecode360.com/SA4625 on 2026-02-09


https://ecode360.com/SA4625

City of San Pablo, CA
§ 15.04.020 8 15.04.020

Downloaded from https://ecode360.com/SA4625 on 2026-02-09


https://ecode360.com/SA4625

City of San Pablo, CA
8 17.62.160 817.62.160

alternative:
(Ord. 2023-001 § 2, 2023)

Downloaded from https://ecode360.com/SA4625 on 2026-02-09


https://ecode360.com/SA4625

